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TERMS OF USE 

These Terms of Use include, and are not limited to, the terms of the Software License 

Agreement, Permissions & Trademarks, and the On-Line Privacy Policy (collectively the 

“Terms of Use”), which are found throughout portabletoiletsoftware.com and ritam.com 

(the "Site"). 

BY USING THE SITE, YOU AGREE TO THESE TERMS. IF YOU DO NOT AGREE, DO NOT USE 

THE SITE. 

Ritam Technologies, LLC ("Ritam") reserves the right, at its sole discretion, to change, 

modify, add or remove portions of these Terms of Use, at any time. It is your responsibility 

to check these Terms of Use periodically for changes. Your use of the Site means that you 

accept and agree to the Terms of Use. As long as you comply with these Terms of Use, 

Ritam grants you a personal, non-exclusive, non-transferable, limited privilege to enter 

and use the Site. 

CONTENT: All text, graphics, user interfaces, visual interfaces, photographs, trademarks, 

logos, sounds, music, artwork and computer code (collectively, “Content”), including but 

not limited to the design, structure, selection, coordination, expression, “look and feel” 

and arrangement of such Content, contained on the Site is owned, controlled or licensed 

by or to Ritam, and is protected by trade dress, copyright, patent and trademark laws, and 

various other intellectual property rights and unfair competition laws. Except as expressly 

provided in these Terms of Use, no part of the Site and no Content may be copied, 

reproduced, republished, uploaded, posted, publicly displayed, encoded, translated, 

transmitted or distributed in any way (including “mirroring”) to any other computer, 

server, Web site or other medium for publication or distribution or for any commercial 

enterprise, without Ritam's express prior written consent. 

YOUR USE OF THE SITE: You may not use any automatic device, program, algorithm or 

methodology, or any similar or equivalent manual process, to access, acquire, copy or 

monitor any portion of the Site or any Content, or in any way reproduce or circumvent the 

navigational structure or presentation of the Site or any Content, to obtain or attempt to 

obtain any materials, documents or information through any means not purposely made 

available through the Site. Ritam reserves the right to bar any such activity. You may not 

attempt to gain unauthorized access to any portion or feature of the Site, or any other 
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systems or networks connected to the Site or to any Ritam server, or to any of the services 

offered on or through the Site, by hacking, password “mining” or any other illegitimate 

means. You may not probe, scan or test the vulnerability of the Site or any network 

connected to the Site, nor breach the security or authentication measures on the Site or 

any network connected to the Site. You may not reverse look-up, trace or seek to trace 

any information on any other user of or visitor to the Site, or any other customer of Ritam, 

including any Ritam account not owned by you, to its source, or exploit the Site or any 

service or information made available or offered by or through the Site, in any way where 

the purpose is to reveal any information, including but not limited to personal 

identification or information, other than your own information, as provided for by the 

Site. You agree that you will not take any action that imposes an unreasonable or 

disproportionately large load on the infrastructure of the Site or Ritam's systems or 

networks, or any systems or networks connected to the Site or to Ritam. You agree not to 

use any device, software or routine to interfere or attempt to interfere with the proper 

working of the Site or any transaction being conducted on the Site, or with any other 

person’s use of the Site. You may not forge headers or otherwise manipulate identifiers in 

order to disguise the origin of any message or transmittal you send to Ritam on or 

through the Site or any service offered on or through the Site. You may not pretend that 

you are, or that you represent, someone else, or impersonate any other individual or 

entity. You may not use the Site or any Content for any purpose that is unlawful or 

prohibited by these Terms of Use, or to solicit the performance of any illegal activity or 

other activity which infringes the rights of Ritam Technologies, LLC or others. 

ON-LINE LICENSE AGREEMENT: This On-Line License Agreement is separate and different 

from the license agreement under which all of our software products are 

licensed. Please reference the link at the bottom of this page to see the Software Licensing 

Agreement and Warranty. 

1. Attention: The software programs, video demonstrations, screen samples, eBooks, and

related product information contained on this Website (collectively termed “software”) are

the sole property of Ritam Technologies, LLC (“Ritam”). It is licensed to the user and is not

sold. As such, this license defines the permitted uses and contains limitations on

warranties and your remedies. By opening, installing, and/or using this software, you and

your company for whom this is being licensed are agreeing to the terms, conditions, and

limitations of this licensing agreement. If you do not agree to this licensing agreement,

please do not view or download the software. Failure to abide by the limitations of this

license is subject to remedies permitted under copyright law and in equity.
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2. Limitations: The user agrees not to de-compile, reverse engineer, disassemble, or 
otherwise use this software as a model for creating a competitive product. All rights not 
expressly granted shall remain with Ritam, its principals, and heirs.

3. Warranty: We specifically disclaim any and all implied or express warranties, 
representations, or conditions, whether warranty of fitness for a particular purpose, 
warranty of merchantability, or any others.

4. Supercedes: This software licensing agreement and warranty supercedes and/or 
replaces any and all written or oral statements regarding licensing of Ritam software on 
this website regardless of whether those statements indicate a guarantee, warranty, or 
anything which may seem to impact the licensing and use of Ritam software on this 
website. Any separately shipped software will have its own license agreement, 
independent of the current document.

5. No Consequential Damages: The risk of use and all consequences thereof, whether 
direct or indirect, reside solely with the user, including but not limited to loss of use, loss of 

anticipated profit or revenue, cost of repair and any other consequence which may result, 

even if we have foreseen or been advised of such losses or their possibility beforehand. In 

no event will our liability for any damages exceed the licensing fee paid to us.

6. Governance, Changes: This license shall be governed by and construed in accordance 
with the laws of the State of California, excluding the U.N. Convention on Contracts for the 
International Sale of Goods. If any provision of this license is declared by a Court or arbiter 
of proper jurisdiction to be invalid, illegal, or unenforceable, such provision shall be 
severed from the license, while the other provisions shall remain in full force and effect. 
Any modifications to this agreement must be in writing and signed by both parties, except 
as to implied acceptance of revisions included with updates or upgrades of the software 
from Ritam.

7. Disputes: In order to speedily and most economically resolve disputes irresolvable 
between the parties, it is further agreed that such disputes will be submitted to binding 
arbitration with the American Arbitration Association at their San Francisco, CA, office or 
nearest office to Sacramento, CA. Loser of such arbitration shall be responsible for all 
attorney's fees, costs of filing and collecting, and any and all other costs relating to 
resolution of the dispute. Enforcement of binding arbitration may then be undertaken 
using the reasonable means necessary and invoking the assistance of other Courts where 
applicable, the costs of which will be borne by the loser.
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8. Termination: Without prejudice of our other rights, we may terminate your right to use

the software if you fail to comply with the terms and conditions of this agreement. You

must then destroy, or return at your expense, all copies of the software, including backup

copies.




